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1862-11-09 

Camp Near Savannah Ga. Nov 9th 1862 

Dear Mary,  

I received yours of the 1st just one week after you wrote it, and I got one a few days before that had 
been written about the same length of time. I was very glad to hear from you, but I do not like to hear of 
you having so much toothache. I am afraid you have been sleeping with your sweet heart to[sic] much. 
Since I have been in the army, I expect you had better quit them tricks or you will be raising young 
soldiers first you know. Do you not think so? Well Mary, I hope this will find you well of the toothache 
and sore neck and the children all well. I have been very well except a bad cold. I have no news to write 
you, we have move[d] again, but that is nothing new to us. Have got used to moving and do not expect 
to stay long at any one camp. We are about half mile nearer town than we were, but not on the Shell 
Road. The 23rd and 30th Ga. Regiments on the south side of the parade ground, we [are] on the north of 
it about three hundred yards square. Mary, it is very cold here this morning while frost and the ice an 
eighth of an inch thick in our buckets. I reckon I will have [to] ask you for more cover. The same quilt I 
had last winter will be enough cover.  You may send me another pillow slip and my pants I had last 
winter, overshirts, and shirts. If your beef is dry send me a piece of it. You can put all in the box I sent 
you the oven in. Can not you pack yourself and the children in in too and put [ring?] in one corner? I 
know there will be enough room for the mare and cows in one end and the hogs in the other. Well I do 
not think I am crazy but I do not think it is right to send for so much with out sending for all, do you? 
Mary, I had like to forgot to say I think if you will not be so thick with your sweetheart I can forgive you 
about the bread this time and I expect your teeth and neck will get well by that means, don’t you think 
so? I do. We do not get to[sic] much to eat now that is of meat, we get plenty meal but we can not eat 
it, it is old and bitter. We get right [smarts?] of rice but not get any grease and but one pound bacon for 
fifteen days and that will [not?] grease much rice or any thing else. Get a pound of beef six days in the 
week but we eat it stewed or broiled if one get anything from home he set over it all the time or they 
will steal it all from him in a few hours [cut-off] this is not very incouraging[sic], but it is so in the camps 
around here. If accounts we get [from] other places be true we get help to eat [there?] other division of 
the army. I have not the least doubt but there is foul play done in the ration line here, we have to do a 
good deal of picket duty of the worst [kind? cut off]. We have to stand on dams in the marsh day [and] 
night without shelter or fire when it rains [cut-off] not even a place to sit down, only in the mud and 
water. I hope there is better times coming and not far ahead. I would not care if it did not make the men 
sick so bad, I hope the future has a bright [leaf?] in store for us, all that lives to enjoy it. Well Mary, I am 
done croaking. I want you to write me all about everything, how all your affairs are getting along, if you 
had your [cane?] saved before the cold ruined it, and how your potatoes has[sic] turned out. If you have 
got them dug, if you have got enough seed peas and ground peas saved, how your hogs are fattening; all 
every thing[sic] about the place and the new ground to[sic]. And if you would not like to have the old 
patch worked over a few times these cold nights, or do you think it would be to[sic] good to take these 
hard times. I would like mighty well to be plough boy a few nights if it would not be injurious to health. 
Mary, you must not show this to any body.      

Your husband in love, 

       William W. Knight. 


