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THE CAiRO MESSENGER. FRIDAY^APRIL 17, 1987

gstnbllshed January 5, 1904

Entered as second-class mat- 
January 14th at the Post Of­

fice at Cairo, Georgia 31728, 
^der the act of March 3rd 
1879-
F^lVIND^Editor fromMay 1 
1?>4 to September, 1922.

WwTsR.,Editor 
September 1922, to August 15,

R-E. WIND, Editor from 
August 15,1957 to March 1,1968.

H.H. WIND, JR., Publisher 
from August 15,1957 to June 1, 
1980.

RH- (Bobby) WIND, Editor 
and Publisher.

Prospective Students 
Of Journalism 
Eligible

Added this year to the 
growing list of scholarships 
available to local high school 
seniors is the Fuller J. Wind 
Scholarship of $500 being 
offered by the Messenger 
Publishing Co. to foster the 
study of journalism.

The award will be given 
annually by the Wind family, 
owners of the Cairo Messen­
ger, to a student who “exhi­
bits outstanding qualities in

Column cj 
and stroar

R.L. (Bobby) VanLandingham scholarship” and for the pur­
pose of “the continuation of 
excellence in journalism.

Staff Writer

The polls 
ing has bee' 
one contact • 
of A. as of h I

That's gel 
figured that 1 
last year the 
deners migh 
out somewhl 
are comingj 
than ever. I

Last yea’i 
Everett wo ’ 
didn’t even I 
den peas ’]

MEMBER 
Georgia Press Association 

and
National Editorial Association

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
(Payable in Advance) 

One Year (In Grady Co.) $7.28 
One Year (In Ga.) $8.84 

One Year (Outside Ga.) $8.50 
Single Copy 20c

In notifying us of change of 
address, it is very important 
that you give both the old and 
new addresses. Do not wait for

Fuller J. Wind scholars 
must have demonstrated out­
standing leadership in their 
high school; maintained a high 
rank in their class; and plan to 
enroll in a four-year college to 
pursue a major or minor in 
journalism, according to the 
scholarship guidelines.

Applicants for the scholar­
ship are now being screened 
by school authorities and don- ' 
ors with the 1987 recipient to 
be announced during the । 
Cairo High School Honors

the Post Office to report to us Night program.
as this is an additional expense.

Copy for advertisement must 
be in the hands of the printer no 
later than 12 o’clock noon, 
Tuesday of the week of publica­
tion.

Advertising rates reasonable 
and made known on applica­
tion.

CAIRO
15 YEARS AGO _

Friday, April 14,1972
Perhaps the greatest and 

most wholesome entertain­
ment attraction ever present­
ed locally is set for Saturday 
night when the FSU “Hying 
High” circus performs at the 
Syrupbowl stadium, sponsor­
ed by the Cairo Kiwanis Club.

-0-
Mary Kravig was named

In the event there are no 
eligible graduates in a given 
year, the annual award can be 
given to a previous Wind 
Scholar who is still enrolled in 
a four-year college and pursu­
ing a major or minor degree in 
journalism.

Because it is a merit-based 
scholarship, demonstrated 
financial need is not a consid­
eration in selecting the win­
ner.

Fuller J. Wind, from whom 
this latest scholarship avail­
able to high school graduates 
is named, became owner, edi­
tor, and publisher of the Cairo 
Messenger in 1904 and con­
tinued in those capacities until 
his death in 1922 at the age of 
seventy.

He was born in Thomasville 
in 1852, the son of John Wind, 
an English immigrant archi-

THE LATE FULLER J. WIND, former editor and 
publisher of the Cairo Messenger, as he appeared 
late in his career as a newspaperman.
school authorities, “Lessons 
should be studied in the 
forenoon and heard in the 
afternoon so teachers would 
be available to help in lesson 
study because untutored par­
ents can’t.”

During local community 
concern over the possible sale 
of “near beer” in 1909, Mr. 
Wind wrote an editorial ques­
tioning if the beverage was 
truly an intoxicant and then 
reported the next week, 
“Hearsay has it that during 
services at both the Methodist 
and Baptist Churches the 
Messenger came in for a share 
of lambasting along with the

flowers, food, support and 
acts of kindness shown to 
them in the loss of their loved 
one.

M. L. Jones 
Betty Mayfield 

Jean Porter 
Sue Smith 

Cathy Burdette
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tect who designed the Susina
best defensive player; Rae- piantation house near Beach- 
nelle Cliett the best offensive 
player and best field goal 
percentage shooter and Janet 
Dixon the best free throw 
shooter for the Syrupmaids 
while Craig Taylor was named 
best free throw shooter; 
Franklin Perry the best field 
goal shooter, best rebounder 
and most valuable player; and 
Melvin Ray the besl def n.s‘v^ 
player at the 197? basketball

ton and the main house on 
Greenwood Plantation as well 
as other residences in or near 
Thomasville.

Fuller J. Wind, who prided

devil.
Commenting on 1914 fash­

ions, Editor Wind wrote, “The 
disgustingly high cut, bottle 
shaped, tight fitting skirts 
with hardly room for the 
pedalugical extremities, and 
ahoes that look more like 
broom straws stuck, in poof;^ 
land potatoes and stockings 
that look like they need

banquet.

B. Roddenbery Co. 
word like to introduce to the 
peole of Cairo and Grady 
Couty Mr. Gene Smith who 
bean his employment with 
thin last week.

' ‘ CAIRO
30 YEA^AGO

; ■

Friday, April 12,1957
Six committees are making 

preliminary plans for the 
annual “Hospital Day, May 
17th, held by the Hospital 
Auxiliary-

Gloria Dollar, daughter of 
Mr and Mrs. Wendell Dollar,

himself on his printing expei 
tise, followed his trade and 
profession for fifty-five years, 
working with both the Thom­
asville Press and Bainbridge 
Argus before purchasing the 
Cairo Messenger in 1904.

He and his paper quickly 
became an integral part of the 
young community with Mr. 
Wind, through his writings, 
playing an important part in 
the formation of Grady Coun­
ty in 1905.

Perseverance, through 
good and ill fortune, was a 
trademark of his character 
and he was known to be fair to 
opposition, always showing a 
disposition to yield to reason.

On noting his death in 1922, 
Milton L. Fleetwood, editor of 
the Cartersville, Ga. Times 
called him "one of the outst­
anding figures in Georgia 
journalism,” and the Tifton 
Gazette, in memoriam, des­
cribed him as “a 
character in South

notable
Geo; gid

Grady County^
The editor of the Thomas-

darning probably do .more 
good than harm because they 
carry women and girls to 
church even though they go 
dressed so indecently."

In 1916 he commented in 
print, “There are only two 
classes of people in Grady 
County, boosters and kick­
ers,” then asked, "To which 
class do you belong?’'

After a 1905 Knights of 
Pythias party in Cairo Editor 
Wind wrote, "Inspired by the 
soft effulgence of gentle Luna, 
whose mellow radiance was 
intensified by dozens of Jap­
anese lanterns suspended am­
ong the leafy branches, no 
doubt romance filled the soul 
of many a gallant youth and 
into the ear of his starry-eyed 
companion he poured the old, 
yet ever-new story.”

And during the “hard 
times” of 1922, shortly before 
his death he commented edi­
torially, “The agitator and 
exaggerator - those useless 
biped-, who feel called upon to 
stand around and forever talk
and gossip and overdraw - 
sho ;id be barred forever from I 
any and all progressive towns k

A2660RC —
26" CABlE-COMPAI 
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Experience entertainment j
This deluxe 267 console c 
exceptions beauty and ex 
Mathes features. Built-in F 
stereo/SAP ready, .42-cha 
tuning, deluxe . ii ?d rem. 
cnannel/clock a sp-ay. auc 
inputs/outputs, deluxe 2-»v 
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glass tri Jit or e; styling g-| 
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Alvah Reagan is the 
assistant postmaster in Cairo 
succeeding Charlie Browne 
svho retired March 1st. Uve up t0 the Golden Rule" 

.  and the Apalachicola Times

ville Press commented in 
mourning Wind’s death, .10 
man can say he ever failed to

GAB RO 
45 YEARS AGO

Friday, April 17,1942
A joint campaign for fund.- 

for the United China Relief 
ond the Navy Relief Society 
will start in Cairo and Gradv 
County next Sunday, April
19th.

-0-
Ail persons who use coal 

cre urged to place their 
rders now for next winter's 
apply *n order to cooperate 

S ith the war e^ort by thus 
the transportation

wrote, “He was a believer in 
doing all things well.

One fellow publisher of a 
Georgia weekly called him “A 
thorough thinker.”

Although primarily a “mas­
ter printer,” Fuller J. Wind 
wrote concisely, to the point, 
and without question as to 
meaning when the situation 
called for it but could also 
master the profusely descrip 
five phrase of turn of-the cen 
tury prose when such was 
needed.

In 1911 he wrote in the 
Messenger for the benefit of

for they are far worse than 
any ordinary detriment to 
good fellowship and a pro­
gressive spirit in a town."

Descendants of Fuller J. 
V. ind who are currently asso­
ciated with the Cairo Messen­
ger Lope this scholarship hon­
oring the earlier editor and 
publisher will encourage high 
school students to consider 
journalism as a profession.

CARD OF THANKS

The family of Mrs. Susie 
Cornelia Jones would like to 
express their appreciation 
and gratutide for the nr: v^r<
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is additional expense.
r^opyforadvertisement must 

I .111 the hands of the printer no 
Jer than 12 o’clock noon, 
tiQ^^y the week of publica- 

Advertising rates reasonable 
a.nd Blade known on applica­
tion.

Cairo
15 YEARSAGO

Friday, April 14,1972
Perhaps the greatest and 

most wholesome entertain­
ment attraction ever present­
ed locally is set for Saturday 
night when the FSU *T lying 
High” circus performs at the 
Syrupbowl stadium, sponsor­
ed by the Cairo Kiwanis Club.

-0-
Mary Kravig was named 

best defensive player; Rae- 
nelle Cliett the best offensive 
player and best field goal 
percentage shooter and Janet 
Dixon the best free throw 
shootc. for the Syrupmaids 
while Craig Taylor was named 
best free throw shooter; 
Franklin Perry the best field 
goal shooter, best rebounder 
and most valuable player; and 
Melvin Ray the best defensive 
player at the 1972 basketball 
banquet.

-0-
W. B. Roddenbery Co. 

would like to introduce to the 
people of Cairo and Grady 
County Mr. Gene Smith who 
began his employment with 
them last week.

CAIRO 
30 YEARS AGO

Friday, April 12,1957
Six committees are making 

preliminary plans for the 
ainual "Hospital Day,” May 
17th, held by the Hospital 
Auxiliary.

-0-
Gloria Dollar, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Dollar, 
is the spelling bee champion of 
Grady County.

-0-
Alvah Reagan is the 

assistant postmaster in Cairo 
succeeding Charlie Browne 
who retired March 1st.

€A!R©
GS YEARS AGO

Friday, April 17,1942
A joint campaign for funds 

for the United China Relief 
and the Navy Relief Society 
will start in Cairo and Grady 
County next Sunday, April 
19th.

-0-
All persons who use coal 

are urged to place their 
orders now for next winter’s 
supply in order to cooperate 
with the war effort by thus 
relieving the transportation 
system that may not be able 
to deliver next winter.

-0-
The resourcefulness of 

George Williams, a well 
known Cairo Negro, has led 
him to start a novel business. 
He’s now raising o’possums 
for sale.

Support Local 
Merchants J S 0 0/*W

w. V - X w

enroll in a four-year college to 
pursue a major or minor in 
journalism, according to the 
scholarship guidelines.

Applicants for the scholar­
ship are now being screened 
by school authorities and don­
ors with the 1987 recipient to 
be announced during the 
Cairo High School Honors 
Night program.

In the event there are no 
eligible graduates in a given 
year, the annual award can be 
given to a previous Wind 
Scholar who is still enrolled in 
a four-year college and pursu­
ing a major or minot' degree in 
journalism.

Because it is a merit-based 
scholarship, demonstrated 
financial need is not a consid­
eration in selecting the win 
ner.

Fuller J. Wind, from whom 
this latest scholarship avail­
able to high school graduates 
is named, became owner, edi­
tor, and publisher of the Cairo 
Messenger in 1904 and con­
tinued in those capacities until 
his death in 1922 at the age of 
seventy.

He was born in Thomasville 
in 1852, the son of John Wind, 
an English immigrant archi­
tect who designed the Susina 
Plantation house near Beach­
ton and the main house on 
Greenwood Plantation as well 
as other residences in or near 
Thomasville.

Fuller J. Wind, who prided 
himself on his printing exper­
tise, followed his trade and 
profession for fifty-five years, 
working with both the Thom­
asville Press and Bainbridge 
Argus before purchasing the 
C airo Messenger in 1904.

He and his paper quickly 
became an integral part of the 
young community with Mr. 
Wind, through his writings, 
playing an important part in 
the formation of Grady Coun­
ty in 1905.

Perseverance, through 
good and ill fortune, was a 
trademark of his character 
and he was known to be fair to 
opposition, always showing a 
disposition to yield to reason.

On noting his death in 1922, 
Milton L. Fleetwood, editor of 
the Cartersville, Ga. Times 
called him “one of the outst­
anding figures in Georgia 
journalism,” and the Tifton 
Gazette, in memoriam, des­
cribed him as “a notable 
character in South Georgia 
journalism.”

The editor of the Thomas­
ville Press commented in 
mourning Wind’s death, No 
man can say he ever failed to 
live up to the Golden Rule” 
and the Apalachicola Times 
wrote, “He was a believer in 
doing ail things well.

One fellow publisher of a 
Georgia weekly called him “A 
thorough thinker.”

Although primarily a “mas­
ter printer," Fuller J. Wind 
wrote concisely, to the point, 
and without question as to 
meaning when the situation 
called for it but could also 
master the profusely descrip­
tive phrase of turn-of-the cen 
tury prose when such was 
needed..

In 1911 he wrote in the 
Messenger for the benefit of

We now have White Linen 
tablecloth with lace skirts for 
weddings. s10.00 per set. Ren­
tal - Plates and cups for wed­
dings. Also punch bowls and 
trays - /Ml found at

Tall. Hwy., Cairo, Ga. 377-4278

I

.. . ;

THE LATE FULLER J. WIND, former editor and 
publisher of the Cairo Messenger, as he appeared 
late in his career as a newspaperman.
school authorities, “Lessons 
should be studied in the 
forenoon and heard in the 
aiternoon so teachers would 
be available to help in lesson 
study because untutored par­
ents can’t.”

During local community 
concern over the possible sale 
of “near beer” in 1909, Mr. 
Wind wrote an editorial ques­
tioning if the beverage was 
truly an intoxicant and then 
reported the next week, 
“Hearsay has it that during 
services at both the Methodist 
and Baptist Churches the 
Messenger came in for a share 
of lambasting along with the 
devil.

Commenting on 1914 fash­
ions, Editor Wind wrote, “The 
disgustingly high cut, bottle 
shaped, tight fitting skirts 
with hardly room for the 
pedalogical extremities, and 
shoes that look more like 
broom straws stuck.in poorrv 
land potatoes and stockings 
that look like they need 
darning probably do more 
good than harm because they 
carry women and girls to 
church even though they go 
dressed so indecently.”

In 1916 he commented in 
print, “There are only two 
classes of people in Grady 
County, boosters and kick 
ers,” then asked, “To which 
class do you belong?”

After a 1905 Knights of 
Pythias party in Cairo Editor 
Wind wrote, “Inspired by the 
soft effulgence of gentle Luna, 
whose mellow radiance was 
intensified by dozens of Jap­
anese lanterns suspended am­
ong the leafy branches, no 
doubt romance filled the soul 
of many a gallant youth and 
into the ear of his starry-eyed 
companion he poured the old, 
yet ever-new story.”

And during the “hard 
times” of 1922, shortly before 
his death he commented edi­
torially, “The agitator and 
exaggerator - those useless 
bipeds who feel called upon to 
stand around and forever talk
and gossip and overdraw - 
should be barred forever from I 
any and all progressive towns 
for they are far worse than 
any ordinary detriment to i 
good fellowship and a pro- I 
gressive spirit in a town."

Descendants of Fuller J. 
Wind who are currently asso- 
ciated with the Cairo Messen­
ger hope this scholarship hon­
oring the earlier editor and 
publisher will encourage high 
school students to consider 1 
journalism as a profession.

CARD OF THANKS

The family of Mrs. Susie 
Cornelia Jones would like to 
express their appreciation 
and gratutide for the prayers,

flowers, food, support and 
acts of kindness shown to 
them in the loss of their loved 
one.

M. L. Jones 
Betty Mayfield 

Jean Porter 
Sue Smith 

Cathy Burdette
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JOHN WIND,
Architect and Practical Builder,

I . THOMASVILLE. GA..
1T> ESPECTFULLYI N FQRMS THE IN HA RITA NTS ’ 
*JX of! Thomas and adjacent Counties, that he intend* 
devoting the greater portion of his time to the Arrhitec- 
tural part of his profession. *uch;as the Drawing of PUum», 

'Elevations. Sections, Detail Drawings. Perspective Views ’ 
of Intended Btdldiugs, Sj»ei'iKcution.'». Bills of Lumber. . 
Elgimatesof Cost. &c.; uxid in soliciting 'mure from
^discriminating public, refers to hi.* well known abilities j 
jfc the above business, a* being the best recommendadotx, • 
i|Fnt would refer to the following gentlemen near Thom* 
^grille:
| The Honorable Inferior Court of Thoma* County.

.a । E. ’Remington &. Son,
|j| : Robert H. Hardaway, £|t»q.,, I

: John W. H_*Mitchell, Efoq.,; 
.; Chas. H. Remington, Eiq., •

Thomasville, Ga.

The Honotgbl* Inferior Cerars of Brook* County.

$ Win. A. Bowen, Em 
<3 W\..

t> Brook* County, Gx

April 18, I860.

Figure 2. John Wind Advertisement, from the 
Thomasville Southern Enterprise, Vol 
IV, No. 3, April 24, 1861 (no page)
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Saturday March 18; . . 1373

Meteorological Observations
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ThoMaitlUf, Ufor^la.

For Lho Wook ending March 18, 1876.
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Mnfdcr 'Toni..
. Tim com nunity ify shocked fast 
Monday morning bwlhe intelligence 
that (he body of MrXobn Laue, a so­
ber, industrious met;lanic had beeu 
found dead near liisB’esidencc in the 
17th District. Bimfo'S of foul play 
followed, and whichipponr to be but 
(oo well founded fijiu the verdict-of 
the jury of inquest, i^e details of this 
revolting ciime are ii cn by Mr. //ar­
ris in the “Cairo fJiipiUmenl of this 
paper. Sullice it io»y (hat it proves 
tohnvc In en a moslftiocking and toul 
murder—robbery bf^’g probably the 
object. The buckbin, the strip of 
calico found, and ollfC Incls connect­
ed with the crime mrF, and we hope 
will, lead to the deletion of the guilty 
parly or parlies, (i/ohne Johnson, 
a colored woman, tAilies io having 
seen a strnnger w|> Mr. Laue Ilie

Oanporfnnt Case A rib Mm fed.
Sometime ago, a bid was (fieri in­

equity by & II. RbbiiDion .adminis- 
trator estate of B. B. Evaqi^e^paK- 
ed against Willis X. Parnell/ shFvii> 
ing partner of the old film of Ev­
ans Parnell alleging that the ^aid 
surviving partner was indebted io, 
the Evans estate. By consent’ of

board of Arbitrators consisting nf 
Judge A. H. Hansell, Col. Win. J. 
Young add Col. Wm. J. McLendon.

She <les-
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Post Office Hours.
From mid after till*date, the ofUcu will be open 

for the ikdlvery of mall, mb follows :
* rom 8 a. m., to 12 m., In the morning.
From 2 to G p. m. In the evening.
From 8 to 9 a. m., onSunda.Vb.
Money Order bmdncBHfrom 8 1-2 a. , until 

12 M, »nJ from 2 to 4 1-2 1*, a.
Front door will bo open ho that parties having 

lock boxes can gel their mall nt all hours. The 
iimiU for all points will close at 5 p ni.

W. C. CARSON, P. J/.
On nuil Mier Oct.. 19th general de­

livery nnd slump office, will close nt 5 
P. M.

evening iH lMre his 
cribcd him as a , 
while man without ; k hoard, dre-srd 
in black and wenrinja Idack hat.1’

Who was this np? He appears 
only once in the drnmuand I hen mys 
tcriously disappears J? th** unknoAn 
stranger be traced in Where Hid he 
come from, and wh^J did he go? —
These arc perimei^ quesumis, ami 
may aid in solving ins gu-at vriun-. -
The following is l 
Jury in th<- case:

Ur-

CHUBCH DIRECTORY.
There will be services in the vari­

ous churches to-morrow as follows:
Methodist Church. — Bev. Mr. 

Cooke. 11 A. M. Sunday School at 
3 P. 31. Services usual hour nt

Thoma.-, i.orxiv. 1 
dented in Miid < minty. mJ 
March, in the \ ua of 
drm and .S- veidx-MX, 
J uslirv nf he Fem r an I 
i utility in view m ihu .iu»i 
and chcie I; l;ig dead. him 
A1 < Imn a ii / Ca 'p<u W; d kj 
John (2. Bryan, William] 
Rogers, .1 aims 4’. Kogu?q 
TlmmiK W. Ballard/Aid 
R. Kooky and Robcit H,

B»h

t

J at t 
. the..

C. Flilll HllH>-liri, 
. Jlvn c\

* H limn I >o. nM'H.i, 
udcr Bn lat'il. John

(nl mcn,uf tin* rmtnly nlL^aid: aim, h;nl»ig 
been । hi I v nwor n ami » h;fpe<| lo m.iuiic on the* 
part of the Shite nh»re*uj(. nhin. when*, how 
and after what ntancer fl e raid John J.ane

Episcopal Church—Bev. Mr. Bab­
bit, Usual hour morning and night. 
Sabbath School 3 o'clock, P. M.

Presbyterian Church--Bev. Mr. 
McKee, 1,1 o’clock A. M. No servi-
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Eirat African Baptist Church- A. 
Delamoftn. Pastor, services every 
Sunday at the usual hours. Sabbath 
School 9 o’clock A. M.

A. M- E- Church--C. L. BradweD, 
Pastor, services every Sunday at the. 
usual hours. Sabbath School at 8 1-2
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in hearing testimony, pleadings, Ac., 
at intervals for several months. On 
Wednesday they made their award 
giving judgement for something over 
six thousand dollars in favor of the 
Evans estate. We understand that 
the award will bo resisted by the de­
fendant and that the rase will go 
into the courts.

KSesidciice BuiobcH,

Mash will be. pained to learn that 
his elegant country residence at 
Duncanville, one of ti c handsomest 
and most costly in the county, was 
entirely destroyed by tire on Monday 
evening last. The Hames were dis­
covered about -1 o’clock in the even­
ing spreading rapidly along the 
roof, and so fast was their progress 
that the family barely had time to 
efecape, before the entire roof fell in. 
Scarcely anything was. sav<-.d No 
insurance. It is supposed ■ that the 
shingles caught from sparks.

Our warmest sympathies :we ten­
dered to the Major in this his un­
timely loss, and in them we are join • 
ed by the whole cormunity.

There has been some talk of this 
large excursion party taking this 
place in their route, but we have 
nothing definite on the subject. 
Mayor McLean, telegraphed the 

•Mayor of Atlanta day before yester­
day relative to the time of their ar­
rival, but got nothing definite in re-

should hn taken in the mutter.
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